
Attachment E 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

This page intentionally left blank.  



Attachment E 
AG-1.12 The County shall prepare, adopt, and implement a program that requires projects  

involving a change of land use designation resulting in the loss of Important  
Farmland (as mapped by the California Department of Conservation Farmland  
Mapping and Monitoring Program) to mitigate the loss of that acreage. For such  
land to be annexed to incorporated areas, the County shall work in consultation  
with the cities to mitigate the loss of Important Farmland resulting from  
annexation. The program may include ratios, payment of fees, or some other  
mechanisms. Mitigation mechanisms established through this program shall be  
based upon a graduated value of the Important Farmland, with mitigation for loss  
of prime land having the highest agricultural value. The County shall support  
private, non-profit land trusts and conservation organizations to promote the  
policies of this General Plan, facilitate the implementation of the program, and to  
receive, by voluntary donation or purchase, development rights on any lands to be 
preserved as part of this program’s implementation strategy.  

The acreage within a project or annexation that is to be utilized for inclusionary 
housing shall not be subject to this mitigation policy. A Community Plan or  
Rural Center Plan that includes a mitigation program shall not be subject to this 
policy. Annexations or sphere of influence amendments covered by the Greater  
Salinas Area Memorandum of Understanding (GSA MOU) shall be consistent  
with and governed by the terms of the GSA MOU and with the City’s General  
Plan.  

Until such time as the program has been established, the County shall consult and  
cooperate with the cities so that projects shall mitigate the loss of Important  
Farmland on an individual basis as much as is feasible as determined by the Board 
of Supervisors. 
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